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Meyers, Robert COE 1t’Q lb
From: Meyers, Robert COE

Sent: Thursday, February 04, 2010 2:40 PM

To: Meyers, Robert COE

Subject: RE: Taste of Pinecrest

Commissioner Gimenez may allocate funds out of his discretionary account for the Taste of Pinecrest.

Robert Meyers
February 4, 2010

From: Sanchez, Gerald CAO
Sent: Wednesday, February 03, 2010 3:54 PM
To: Meyers, Robert COE
Cc: Balzebre, Frank DIST7
Subject: Fwd: Taste of Pinecrest

As promised. Thanks

Sentfrom my iPhone

Begin forwardedmessage:

From: "Baizebre,FrankDIST7" <frankb@miamidade.gov>
Date:February2,201010:57:33AM EST
To: "Sanchez,GeraldCAO" <gksmiamidade.gov>
Subject: FW: Taste of IPinecrest

Hi Gerald
Inson wanted to run this by you for clarification..are we OK here in allocating funds today at 6CC?
Frank

Original

Message

From: Balzebre, Frank DIST7
Sent: Tuesday, February 02, 2010 10:50 AM
To: Balzebre, Frank DIST7
Subject: FW: Taste of Pinecrest

From: Kim, Inson DIST7
Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2010 9:59 AM
To: Balzebre, Frank DIST7
Subject: Fw: Taste of Pinecrest

Can u handle this?

From: Amy Simons

2/4/20 10
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To: Kim, Inson DIST7; Balzebre, Frank DIST7
Cc: elenas@mathmonkey.com ; Larrybarditch@aol.com ; ADetailEtc@aol.com
Sent: Thu Jan 28 09:56:44 2010
Subject: Taste of Pinecrest
Good morning, I know you are both downtown in meetings all day.

We are pleased to hear that Commissioner Gimenez is interested in sponsoring the Taste of
Pinecrest scheduled for March 7th in Pinecrest Gardens. Yes, The $3000 water bottle sponsor level
is still available. However, we are right at deadline for having the labels produced.
We will need your fee as soon as possible in order to begin production. Will you have camera-ready
artwork?
I will forward the specs to you later today.

This is a wonderful event and I am sure he will benefit greatly from this community support.

Thank you and please call or email me back with any questions,
Amy Simons
Event Manger

Amy Simons
Details Etc Inc.
7210 Red Road #214
South Miami, Florida 33143
305.662.8024
305.662.8502 fax
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