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Meyers, Robert (COE) . FNR 0oT7-144

From: Meyers, Robert (COE)

Sent:  Monday, September 17, 2007 2:04 PM
To: Ryan, Timothy (MDCR)

Subject: Ethics Opinion

Dear Director Ryan,

linadvertently deleted the e-mail you sent me last week, but | am in possession of your fax concerning the $1,000
the Prison Rape Elimination Commission has offerad you for your work with the Commission. You ask whether
you may accept this "honorarium®. Under Florida law, the payment for services rendered by you to the
Commission s not considered an honorarium, Rather, it should be defined as outside employment income and
should be reported as such. Therefore, if you accept the $1,000 payment in 2007, you should report it by July 1,
2008 with the Supervisor of Elections. If you accept the payment and subsequently donate it, there is nothing for
you to report to Miami-Dade County. If you take this course of action, | would simply keep a record of the fact that
you donated the $1,000 payment,

Please keep in mind that any paid consulting activities require prior approval of your superiors. | realize the
above was a unigue situation, as you were not expecting to be paid for your efforts and you were not employed by
Miami-Dade County when you began your efforts on behalf of the Prison Rape Elimination Commission.

If you have any further questions, please do not hesitate to contact me at your convenience.

Sincerely,

Robert Meyers, Executive Director

Miami-Dade Commission on Ethics and Public Trust
(305) 350-0613

YW17/2007
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Memorandum i

Date: August 28, 2007
To: George M. Burgess
County Manager
Via: Alina T, Hudak
Assistant County Manager
From: Timothy P. Ryan, Direct

Corrections & Rehabilitati

Subject: Honorarium Offer (ra. Acceptance Approval]

Pursuant to the enclosed, | have been offered an honararium of one thousand dollars for my work for the Prigan
Rape Elimination Commission, This is something new and has not been offered before this, Az we discussed
when | assumed the position of Director of MDCR, | advised that It was of personal and professional importance
to maintain my connections with the national intarests in Corrections. The PREA is cerfainly one of those
important connections. However, | never expected to receive any special gompensation for such service.

Relative to the enclosed though, they are describing it as a “consultant fee” which meant that | have a contract for
sanvices, seerningly meaning that 1 had an outside work authorization from your office. Since | had nct exptched
this, | had nat sought permission to attend under this category. However, gince this seems to have changed. |
would respectfully request approval to attend such maetings with such racognition.  (Note: |t is expected that
there will be at least one more such meeting this fall without compensation. )

As to the honorarium, | would certainly itke to accept it persenaily, but recognize the propristy of that may appear
clouded. As such, | would like to accept the honararium, but make it as & special coniribution to the United Way,
poesibly at their Galf Tournament for Nearest the Bin and Largest Drive Awards.

Thank you for your time and consideration in this mattar,

APPROVED ' . . DISAPPROVED

Alna T, Audak Date Alina 1. Hudak —
Assistant County Manager Assistant Gounty Manager
George M. Burgess Date George M. Burgess

County Manager County Manager

TPR/Ihg

¢ Tyrone W. Williams, Esauire
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Garrett, Linda H. (MDCR)

From: Jennifer Troviliion [jtrovilion@nprec.us)

Sent:  Tussday, July 31, 2007 2,63 PM

Ce: Richard Hoffman: Richard Tewksbury; Busansky Alexander; Michela Bowman; Sharcen Brett
Subject: NPREC Standards Expert Committee - Honoratium - forwarded on behalf of Richard B, Hoffman

Dear NPREC Standards Expert Committee member,

On behalf of the National Prison Rape Elimination Commission, | would like to thank you for your participation in
the standards drafting process, including your willingness to travel to Washington, D.C., ta participate in the
Expert Committee meetings held in the past few months. As you know, we will be holding a second round of
these meetings in the coming weeks to go over subsequent drafts of the standards and hapefully produce a
cohasive, comprehensive document to bring before the NFREG Commissioners. The standards writing process is
both labarious and incredibly important, The NPREC and Vera Institute of Justice staff are incredibly grateful for
your time and input into this difficul task.

As a way of thanking you for your contributions to this process, we would like to provide each of you with a one-
time honoratiurn of $1,000 in the form of & "consultant fee.” In order to be eligible to receive this honorarium, you
mist have sither attended the spring Expart Commiltee mesting, o plan on attending the fall mesting. |f you are
on one of the two groups that has not yet met, you will need 1o attend at least one of the two upcoming meetings
in order to receive this honararium, We cannot provide the honorarium o your organization or company - ft must
ge diractly to you, unlees your company ie registered in the Department of Justice Office of Justice Programs
Central Contractor Registry database.

To receive this honorarium, you must complete the attached ACH form and bring it to your bank far a bank
official's sighature. Your information should be added fo the ‘payee’ field. The bank should comptete the financial
institution infarmation. The OJP vendor number on the form will be your social security number,

Please complete the form and return it via mail to NPREC, 1440 New York Avenug, NW, Suite 200, Washingtan,
0.C. 20005, Although we will not issue the fee until you have attended one of the meetings, you do not need to
wait to submit the AGH form until after your attendance — please go ahead and do that now so that we can begin
the processing.

If you cannot accept this honorarium due government regufations regarding you ar your organization, or for any
other reason, please let us know,

Thank you again for your participation in this process We look forward te continuing to work with you, and seeing
you again at the expert committee meetings this falll )

Best regards, ‘

Richard B. Hoffman

FORWARDED BY:

Jenni Trovillion

Chief of Staff

National Prison Rape Efimination Commission
1440 New York Avenua, N'W,, Sulte 200
Washington, D.C. 20005

{202) 233-1082

itrevillion@@nprac,usg

08/01/2007
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ENROLLMENT FORM

This form is used for Automated Clearing House (ACH) payments with I,a'n addendum record that contains payment-
related information processed through the Vendor Exgress Frogram.' Redipiants of thase payments should bring

this information to the attention of their financial institution when presanting this form for completion.

PRIVACY AGT STATEMENT

The foliowing information is provided to comply with the Privacy Act of 1974 (P.L, 93--873); All infor-
mation collected on this form is required under the provisions of 31 U.S.C. 3322 and 31 CFR 210. This
information will be used by the Treasury Department to transmit payment deta, by electronic means to
vendor’s financiel institution, Failure to provide the requested information may delay or prevent the
receipt of payments through ths Automated Clearing House Payment System.

AGENCY INFORMATION '
FEDERAL FHEG RAM AGENCY -
( 0l
L

QFFICE OF JUSTICE PROGRAMS
¥ IDENTIETER: AGENCY LOCATION CODE [ALC):
0JP ] 15-04-0001 \

" |ADDRESS: e rmr—

m— i Ty o ————— e,

vherds!

810 Geventh Street, BN Attn: Qffice Q‘.f the f;r.mptrulj._gr Control Desk
hingt .C. 20531

CONTALT PEASON MAME: : TELEPHONE NUMAER
¢ th roll to ervice Center { gop  ls38-0786

ADDHTIONAL INFORMAT WIN:

- ——

PAYEE/COMPANY INFORMATION /7~ — .
OIP Vendor Number;

ARDARESS

CONTACT PERSON NAME: TELEFHONE NUMBER:

{ }

FINANCIAL INSTITUTION INFORMATION

NAME:

ADDRALSS

ACH COORDINATOR NAME: T TTELEPHONE NUMBER:

MINE-DIGIT RAGUTING TRANSIT MUMBER:

A e mamih  —— o i i e g
—— —

CEFGSITOR ACCOWNT TITLE:

DEPCIRITOR ACCOUNT NUMBER: LRSHKBEDN MUMBER:

TYPE OF ACCOUNT:
Clonecking Osavings [Drocxeox

FIGMATUIRE AMO TIT aF RIZED 1 = T EPHOMNE Al
(Could be the sama ax ACH Cnu'qr'ﬁx;!gfl OFFIGIAL, - =L ONE HUMRER:

BN THAN-O1-214-5908 EITTETY muwg{ﬂﬂ“t ar Fressviy



