Hi Rodzandra,

Please include in INQ 16-87.
Thanks

From: AMG.Esqg. [mailto:agenovalaw@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 2:17 PM

To: Perez, Martha D. (COE)

Cc: Jeannette Genova

Subject: Re: Financial Disclosure - Fernando Infante

Thank you!

Anthony Meehan Genova,Esq.,
~Biscayne Building™

19 West Flagler Street » Suite 802
Miami, Florida 33130

Office 305.379.6000

eFax 305.675.0236

"In God We Trust" Ps 13:5

On Mar 16, 2016, at 1:02 PM, Perez, Martha D. (COE) <perezmd@miamidade.gov> wrote:

Dear Mr. Genova,

Please see email below. It appears that your client does have purchasing authority (over $20,000.00)
which would require him to file Form 1 as discussed in my earlier response. Filing Form 1 satisfies any
additional County requirements. Should you have any additional concerns, do not hesitate to contact
me.

Best regards,

Martha D. Perez

Staff Attorney

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY COMMISSION ON ETHICS & PUBLIC TRUST
19 West Flagler St. Suite 820

Miami, FL. 33130

(305)350-0656

PEREZMD@miamidade.gov

Miami-Dade County is a public entity subject to Florida’s public record laws. Any communication with this office, including e-mail
messages, could be considered a public record subject to disclosure.



From: Dormer, Joan (ISD)

Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 1:46 PM

To: Perez, Martha D. (COE)

Cc: White, Ramona (ISD)

Subject: Financial Disclosure - Fernando Infante

Hi Martha,

Good Afternoon. Per our conversation, Charlotte Horne, Operations Coordinator, Facilities and Utilities
Management Division advised that Mr. Infante processes purchase orders and pays invoices. If you
need any additional information, please contact me.

Best regards,
Joan Dormer



